Below are results for quotations received for Storm Water Repairs work at 4178 and 4179
Woodcrest Drive for your review.

Knight and Associate Incorporated - § 44,350.00
Ardito Construction Company incorporated - § 70,844.00
SC&D Incorporated — Decline to offer a bid

SCA Construction - No response to the bid



Knight & Associates, Inc.

Utilities & General Contractors & Engineering Services

May 14, 2018

Michael Asiedu
City of Powder Springs

Re- Solicitation for Storm Drain Pipe at 4178 and 4179 Woodcrest Drive.

e  Secure utility locate and pothole area.............c.oooi i $1,250

¢ Remove 180 Feet long Storm Drain Pipe, 30 inches diameter Corrugated Metal Pipe

and replace with 30 inches Diameter R.C.P Storm Water Pipe .................... $18,500
o  Allow for road crossing for the R.C.P and replace in kind all road materials for the
U 10 (=0T 6 ¢ SO T R T O TP OT OO $6,900
o Allow for removal of four trees. ..o v $7.500

o  Allow for removal and replacement part of chain-link fence at 4179 Woodcrest
Drive.... $1,900

e  Allow provision for traffic control, road closer and BMP’S..................... $3,900
s Allow desilting all ditch line to ensure continuous flow of storm water......... $2,900

¢ Provide adequate measures to seal off all joints between the existing catch basin and

the new drain pipes to prevent leaks in the future.................o $1,900

» Ensure inlet and outlet pipe system has a positive drainage ....................... $1,500

Lumpsum Total.... ..o $44,350.00
Regards,

Kamal S. Abiodun, P.G.
Principal

1 P.O. Box 671496 Marietta, GA 30006 - 1515 Northwest Drive, Atlanta, GA 30331
Tel: {404) 254-3269, Fax: (404) 692-4371




Ardito Construction Company Inc. Estimate

1290 Austell Road, SE Date Estimate #
Marietta, GA 30008
5/11/2018 475

ARDITO prone/ Fax:  770-435-3776

COHSTRUCTION COKIPARY RN R R .

T E-mail: chuck.ardito@arditocenstruction.com

Name / Address Project
City of Powder Springs
3006 Springs Industrial Dr. ‘Woodcrest Drive 4178/ 4179 Storm Drain
Powder Springs, Ga. 30127
Description Qty Unit Unit Price Total

Storm Drain Replacement
4178/ 4179 Woodcrest Drive
- Asphalt/ Concrete Saw Cut 56]LF. 2.00 112.60
- Hau] Off (Concrete/ Asphalt) 325 |CY. 25.00 812.50
- Haul Off (Dirt) 201CY. 25.00 500.00
- Traffic Control 1L.5. 2,500.00 2,500.00
- Clearing and Grubbing (Tree Removal) 1]1.5. 6,800.00 6,800.00
- Chain Link Fence Removal & Replacement 20| L.E. 20.00 400.00
- 30 inch C.M.P. Storm Drain Pipe Removal and Hau] Off 180 | L.F. 30.00 5,400.00
- Connection to Existing Storm Sewer Manhole 4(EA 350.00 2,200.00
- 30 inch R.C.P. Storm Drain Pipe (6 to 8 ft. Depth) 180 | L.F. 156.35 28,143.00
- 30 inch Precast Concrete Headwall 2|EA 1,150.00 2,380.00
- Catch Basin Throat/Top Removal and Replacement 2|EA 4,425.00 8,850.00
- Type Il Rip Rap { Infet and Outlet Protection ) 10| Ton 105.00 1,050.00
- 24 inches GDOT Type 2 curb/ gutier S0|L.E 32.50 1,625.00
- 8 inches GAB, 6 inches Concrete, Trench Cap 1 foot larger than 480 [ S.F. 10.25 4,920.00
ditch in all directions Tack Coat 2 inches Type E or F Asphalt
- Grading Complete 1|L.S. 2,500.00 2,500.00
- Permanen: Grassing 3,120 | S.F. 0.85 2,652.00

Please Call Me If You Have Any Questions Or Concerns:(678) 618-0240

Estimate Total: $70,844.50




Michael Asiedu

From: Tony Adibe <sdandcinc@yahoo.com>
Sent: Monday, May 07, 2018 5:41 PM

To: Michael Asiedu

Subject: Re: 4178 and 4179 Woodcrest Drive
Michael,

How are you? Sorry we will not be able to send in a bid to you on this one. We are pretty much
covered up for now. Thanks.

Tony

On May 7, 2018, at 10:30 AM, Michael Asiedu <masiedu@CityOfPowderSprings.org> wrote:

The city of Powder Springs is soliciting your quote from replacement of Storm Drain Pipe at
4178 and 4179 Woodcrest Drive.

The scope of work includes the following and must comply with local, state and federal
regulations.

e Remove 180 Feet long Storm Drain Pipe, 30 inches diameter Corrugated Metal Pipe and
replace with 30 inches Diameter R.C.P Storm Water Pipe

Allow for road crossing for the R.C.P and replace in kind all road materials for the road
repairs.

e  Allow for removal of four trees.

e Allow for removal and replacement part of chain-link fence at 4179 Woodcrest Drive.
e Allow provision for traffic control, road closer and BMP’S.

»  Allow desilting all ditch line to ensure continuous flow of storm water

o Provide adequate measures to seal off all joints between the existing catch basin and the
new drain pipes to prevent leaks in the future

Please, you are required to visit the proposed sites to acquaint yourself with the scope of work
before submitting your quote by Monday May 14, 2018 at 12.00pm.

For further questions please contact me vie email.

Thank you,

Michael Asiedu



Michael Asiedu

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Michael,

Tommy Smith <mailscaconstruction@gmail.com>
Tuesday, May 08, 2018 6:21 PM

Michael Asiedu

Michael Anderson

Re: 4178 and 4179 Woodcrest Drive

This is Luke in the SCA office. Thanks for the email. We will be in touch ASAP!

Thanks,

TLuke

Luke Lovell
Office Manager
SCA Construction
770-547-2439

On Mon, May 7, 2018 at 10:29 AM, Michael Asiedu <masiedu@cityofpowdersprings.org> wrote:

The city of Powder Springs is soliciting your quote from replacement of Storm Drain Pipe at 4178 and 4179

Woodcrest Drive.

The scope of work includes the following and must comply with local, state and federal regulations.

e Remove 180 Feet long Storm Drain Pipe, 30 inches diameter Corrugated Metal Pipe and replace
with 30 inches Diameter R.C.P Storm Water Pipe

e Allow for road crossing for the R.C.P and replace in kind all road materials for the road repairs.

e  Allow for removal of four trees.

o Allow for removal and replacement part of chain-link fence at 4179 Woodcrest Drive.

¢ Allow provision for traffic control, road closer and BMP’S.

¢ Allow desilting all ditch line to ensure continuous flow of storm water

¢ Provide adequate measures to seal off all joints between the existing catch basin and the new drain
pipes to prevent leaks in the future



